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Digital games offer a vast range of engaging experiences, from the serene exploration of beautifully rendered
landscapes to the deeply cognitive challenges presented by strategic simulations to the adrenaline rush of
competitive team-based shoot-outs. Digital games enable experiences that are considerably different from a
reader's engagement with literature or a moviegoer's experience of a movie. In In-Game, Gordon Calleja
examines what exactly it is that makes digital games so uniquely involving and offers a new, more precise,
and game-specific formulation of this involvement. One of the most commonly yet vaguely deployed
concepts in the industry and academia alike is immersion--a player's sensation of inhabiting the space
represented onscreen. Overuse of this term has diminished its analytical value and confused its meaning,
both in analysis and design. Rather than conceiving of immersion as a single experience, Calleja views it as
blending different experiential phenomena afforded by involving gameplay. He proposes a framework (based
on qualitative research) to describe these phenomena: the player involvement model. This model
encompasses two constituent temporal phases--the macro, representing offline involvement, and the micro,
representing moment-to-moment involvement during gameplay--as well as six dimensions of player
involvement: kinesthetic, spatial, shared, narrative, affective, and ludic. The intensified and internalized
experiential blend can culminate in incorporation--a concept that Calleja proposes as an alternative to the
problematic immersion. Incorporation, he argues, is a more accurate metaphor, providing a robust foundation
for future research and design.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Ayala:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled In-Game: From
Immersion to Incorporation? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You recognize beside you can
spend your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you
have various other opinion?

Mary Nixon:

The reserve untitled In-Game: From Immersion to Incorporation is the book that recommended to you to
study. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you actually. The language that
article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate.
You also could possibly get the e-book of In-Game: From Immersion to Incorporation from the publisher to
make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Irene Carpenter:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day long to
reading a reserve. The book In-Game: From Immersion to Incorporation it is rather good to read. There are a
lot of individuals who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book
from your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book provides high quality.

Marilyn Fox:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be read. In-
Game: From Immersion to Incorporation can be your answer mainly because it can be read by an individual
who have those short spare time problems.
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