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This book provides both practitioners and academics with a scientific approach to portfolio selection using
Goal Programming, an approach which is capable as far as is possible of achieving a required set of
preferences deemed appropriate by a decision maker. Goal Programming is perhaps the most widely-used
approach in the field of multiple criteria decision-making that enables the decision maker to incorporate
numerous variations of constraints and goals. The original portfolio selection problem, with risk and return
optimisation, can be viewed as a case of Goal Programming with two objectives. Additional objectives
representing other factors, such as liquidity, can be introduced for a more realistic approach to portfolio
selection problems. This book comes in a time where scientific frameworks for investment decision-making
are absolutely necessary, that is after the recent financial and economic crisis; where irrational decisions and
a misuse of mathematical models had equally fed into the spiral of the financial crisis. The real-world
decision problems are usually changeable, complex and resist treatment with conventional approaches.
Therefore, the optimisation of a single objective subject to a set of rigid constraints is in most cases
unrealistic, and that is why Goal Programming was introduced, in an attempt to eliminate or at least mitigate
this shortcoming. Most mathematical models are based on very strong theoretical assumptions which are not
entirely respected by markets in practice. In contrast, Goal Programming models are based on real-world
cases where the most feasible solution is sought as opposed to an ideal simplified solution. Therefore, this
book provides practitioners with a new and superior scientific framework for investment decision-making,
while aiming to stimulate further research and development. Moreover, the book provides scientific
approaches for portfolio selection with Goal Programming, which will provide added value for practitioners
in complementing their financial expertise with a sound scientific decision-making framework.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Byler:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for us to
be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or maybe goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Investment Portfolio Selection Using Goal Programming: An Approach to
Making Investment Decisions.

Jeffrey Haller:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Investment Portfolio Selection Using Goal Programming:
An Approach to Making Investment Decisions as the daily resource information.

Teresa Spillman:

This Investment Portfolio Selection Using Goal Programming: An Approach to Making Investment
Decisions is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some information as it relief your hunger
details. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest
in reading this Investment Portfolio Selection Using Goal Programming: An Approach to Making Investment
Decisions can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this book is easy to get by
simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-
book web form. People who think that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the
answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It
should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also
knowledge.

Douglas Johnson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of news. On this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
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when you needed it?
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